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Name: Taryn Petrovich     

Running for the posi�on of:  Director (2-year term)  

Residence: Calgary, Alberta  

 

Relevant Educa�on, Career and Volunteer and Ska�ng Experience 

As senior legal counsel at a large interna�onal company I have both lead teams as well as been 
part of teams managing change within a corporate se�ng.  I have a Bachelor of Commerce 
degree from Queen’s University and a Bachelor of Laws from the University of Calgary.  I have 
been prac�cing law for 18 years in corporate commercial roles where I have been responsible 
for reviewing and dra�ing contracts and policies as well as providing counsel and advice on legal 
and strategic issues.   For the past several years I was responsible for leading the charitable 
ini�a�ves for my company, including organizing and running numerous volunteer ac�vi�es and 
fundraisers.    

I skated in my youth, throughout university on a Varsity Figure Ska�ng team, and have returned 
to figure ska�ng as an adult by joining a synchronized ska�ng team.  For the past 3 years I 
helped to organize the Calgary Synchronized Ska�ng Club (CSSC) annual Rose Bowl compe��on, 
including coordina�ng all media communica�ons, developing promo�onal material and 
coordina�ng the opening and closing ceremonies.  I have recently become a qualified Star 1-4 
Event Assessor and am working towards my Star 6-Gold Evaluator cer�fica�on.  I am also a 
parent with children that par�cipate in figure ska�ng in both the star and podium pathway 
programs in Alberta. 

Experience Relevant to the Skate AB I NT I NU Board of Directors 

My years of experience prac�cing law provides me with a strong background in corporate 
governance and compliance, as well as an overall understanding of relevant legal obliga�ons.   

My many years involved in figure ska�ng, including as a compe��ve figure skater in the past and 
now as an adult synchronized skater, having children in Skate Canada programs and my 
involvement as an official, has provided me with a strong understanding and knowledge of the 
sport and a good perspec�ve on various interests within the Alberta ska�ng community.  

These skills and perspec�ves would enable me to develop policies, create strategic direc�on and 
deliver results for Skate Canada: Alberta-NWT/Nunavut.  I have a passion for ska�ng and a 
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desire to see all levels and categories of skaters have a posi�ve experience with a goal to 
crea�ng lifelong par�cipa�on. 

 


